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A special meeting was held on August 12, 2009, 3:00 pm at the Shenango Township Municipal
Building with Supervisors Larry Herman, Bob Peters and William Albertini present.

The purpose of the meeting was for the opening of the Road Paving Bids.

The meeting was called to order and the following were opened:

Paving
Youngblood 399,246.60
Sharon Paving 429,355.92
Pro Tech 451,323.70
East Coast Paving 464,392.65
Diorio Paving 4'75,006.69
A Folino 476,352.76
Glenn Johnston Inc 517,777.00

Motion to approve the apparent Jow bidders pending engineering review.

Base Repair

40,000.00

68,000.00

56,000.00

58,000.00

61,580.00

61,000.00

70,000.00

Double Seal

No Bid

No Bid
141,858.36
No Bid
No Bid
182,944.51

214,014.00

Motion by Mr. Albertini second by Mr. Peters to approve Youngblood for paving and base
repair. Pro Tech for double seal, as the apparent low bidders pending engineering review.

Public Comment: None

Motion by Mr. Herman second by Mr. Peters to adjourn.



