I May 10, 1994

SPECIAL MEETING
BIDS FOR ROAD MATERIAL

A special meeting of the Shenango Township board of Supervisors
was held on Tuesday, May 10,:11994 at 3:00 p.m. with supervisors Richard
Schweinsberg and Andrew Piccuta present.

The purpose of the meeting was to received sealed proposals for
the following: Road Materials, Rental Equipment. The following proposals
were received:

#1B Limestone: (FOB/Delivered)
Aloe Stone - 8.35/9.35

West Penn - 8.50/10.50
Medusa - 8.70/9.95

Essroc - 8.75/11.98

Allegh. Min - 9.00/11.50
McQuiston Coal - 9.25/No bid
Romano Paving - No bid/12.00
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l #2 Limestone (FOB/Delivered)

Aloe Stone - 6.80/7.80
Allegheny Mineral - 7.00/9.50
Medusa - 7.25/8.50

McQuiston - 7.40/no bid

West Penn - 7.45/9.45

Essroc - 8.75/11.98

Romano Paving - no bid/11.00

#2A Limestone (FO0B/Delivered)

Medusa - 6.25/7.50

Aloe - 6.40/7.40

McQuiston - 7.10/no bid .
Essroc - 7.25/10.48

Allegheny Mineral - 6.50/9.00
Romano - no bid/10.50

West Penn - 6.50/8.50

#9 Limestone (FOB/Delivered)

Medusa -~ 7.80/9.05

Allegheny Mineral - 9.00/11.50
Essroc - 9.10 - 12.33

Romano Paving - no bid/13.00

I Block Sand (FOB/Delivered)

Rose Point - 3.75/5.25
McQuiston - 5.25/no bid
Aloe - 6.25/7.25

Medusa - 6.50/7.75
Alleh Min - 7.00/9.50
Essroc - 9.10/12.33




S-5 Anti-Skid (FOB/Delivered
Rosepoint -~ 4.75/6.25

E-3M Emulsion (Delivered/Applied)

Frank Martuccio - .78/gallon
Russell Standard - .71 gallon

E-5 Emulsion

Frank Martuccio - .75 gallon
Russell Standard - .685 per gallon

MC-70 Dust 0il

Frank Martuccio - .75 gallon
Russell Standard - .65 gallon

E-1 Tack

Frank martuccio - .70 gallon
Russell Standard - .61 gallon

Id-?2 Hot Mix Wearing (FOB/Delivered)

Romano - 21.00/no bid

West Penn - 21.95/24.00

B & L Asphalt - 23.00/25.00
R.d. Retort - 26.00/30.00

ID-2 hot Mix Base (FOb/Delivered)

Romano Paving - 20.00/no bid
B & L Asphalt - 21.00/23.00
Wst Penn - 21.50/23.55

R.D. Retort - 26.00/30.00

Cold Patch (FOb/Delivered}

RD Retort - 26.00/30.00

West Penn - 28.00/30.05
Russell Standard - 28.50/31.50
Romano - 36.00/38.00

Hot Mix Topping {F0B/Delivered) #9

West Penn - 21.95/24.00
Romano Paving - 22.00/no bid
B & L Asphalt - 23.00/25.00

Premium Lead Free Gasoline/Diesel Fuel/#2 Diesel

Hazen: .619/gallon; .4990/gallon; .539/gallon
Guttman: .6097/gallon; .5344/gallon; .5534/gallon
Agway: .755/gallon; .575/gallon; .660/gallon
** (next page)
Motion by Richard Schweinsberg second by Andrew Piccuta to adjourn.

Teresa K. Sparacino
Secretary-Treasurer
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l **The following bids were received for equipment rental:
Frank Martuccio russell Standard
Paver $ 85.00/hr $ 75.00/hr
Roller {(Tand. Steel) 45.00/hr 38.00/hr
Roller - Pneumatic 40.00/hr 38.00/hr
Dump Trucks 42 .00/hr 38.00/hr
Pug Mill 90.00/hr 65.00/hr
Power Broom 40.00/hr 38.00/hr
Chipper 75.00/hr 75.00/hr
Loader 45.00/hr _ 35.00/hr
Supervisor/truck 38.50/hr 37.50/hr
One Pist. Truck 70.00/hr 40.00/hr

results from May 10, 1994 meeting.




